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Purpose of Report 
  

1. The purpose of this report is to provide the Enfield Health and Adult Social 
Care Scrutiny Panel with an up to date position on the progress of two 
strategic service reviews, one for community services and one for mental 
health services, that the CCG is running. The purpose of the reviews is to 
ensure that over time the North Central London (NCL) Clinical 
Commissioning Group (CCG) commission sustainable and affordable 
community and mental health services for all of its residents. Historically 
the five legacy CCGs commissioned services for their own geographical 
populations. This has led to substantial variation in the ways services are 
commissioned and delivered across NCL. This variation is closely linked 
to different levels of historic funding within the former CCGs.  
 
This report sets out the process the CGG is following in terms of the two 
reviews which are running in parallel. Both reviews started in March and 
are due to complete the initial first three phases by the end of September. 
This report describes the work of the first three phases including providing 
information on the scope of the reviews which are limited to services the 
CCG funds and the governance of the review process.  
 
This report also provides information on user and resident engagement 
which has sought to ensure conversations with a wide range of diverse 
groups across all five Boroughs. The report includes a summary of the 
feedback received and sets out some of the actions the CCG is taking to 
address these comments. 
 
The report includes an update on the work that has been happening over 
August and into September in terms of the refinement of core service 
offers and a detailed gap analysis of the ‘ as is ‘ picture versus the new 
core service offers. This is being finalized ready to be discussed with our 
partners Carnall Farrar who have been supporting the CCG during the 
period from March to September. The intention is that during 
September/October the CCG will be in a position to understand the impact 



including the potential costs of delivering the core service offers. The CCG 
is starting to discuss how the core offers might be commissioned, funded 
and over what timescales could delivery be achieved. Initial internal 
discussions will then be extended to include other partners to discuss and 
agree a NCL approach to an implementation plan. 
 
It is currently anticipated that the CCG’s Governing Body may be able to 
agree an implementation plan by the end of the year, ready to start 
implementation from April 2022. 
 
   

  
Relevance to the Council Plan 
  

2. Community and Mental Health Services provide vital support to Enfield 
residents and the Council and CCG support a number of integrated ways 
of working that will benefit from the CCG’s work to develop core service 
offers for all its residents.  

  
Background 
 

3. The creation of one NCL CCG and the impacts of the Pandemic have 
emphasised the commitment of the CCG to supporting the NHS and 
national agenda on reducing inequalities and improving health and overall 
population outcomes. The work of the reviews will support NCL CCG’s 
commitment to reducing health inequalities by ensuring that all residents 
have access to a consistent range of high quality community and mental 
health services. 

 
 
Main Considerations for the Panel 
  

4. The panel are asked to note the reviews the CCG are currently 
undertaking. 

 
Conclusions 
  

5. This report sets out the work the CCG is currently doing to ensure all NCL 
residents have access to a consistent range of services. At the time of the 
panel meeting it will not be possible to provide more definite information 
on the implications for services in Enfield. This information will be 
available later in the year and the Panel may wish to receive a further 
report which should contain more details on how the core service offer will 
be delivered in Enfield.  
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                               [Job Title] Programme Director for Community and Mental 
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                               [Email] joanne.murfitt1@nhs.net 
 
Date of report          7th September 2021 
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Summary of Engagement Meetings in Enfield 
 
Extracts From Baseline Reports as part of Community and Mental Health Service 
Reviews  
  
Background Papers 
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UPDATE ON THE STRATEGIC SERVICE REVIEWS OF COMMUNITY AND 
MENTAL HEALTH SERVICES 
September 2021 
 

1. INTRODUCTION 
 
1.1 This paper provides the Enfield Health and Adult Social Care Scrutiny 

Panel with an update on the current strategic services review of both 
community and mental health services. The two reviews are being held 
concurrently in recognition of the number of NCL residents needing 
services for both their mental health and physical health needs. In addition 
a number of Trusts involved in the reviews provide both mental health and 
community services so it is more efficient to undertake the reviews in 
parallel, which will identify interdependencies and reduce duplication of 
work associated with the reviews. 

 
1.2 North Central London Clinical Commissioning Group (NCL CCG) has 

inherited a range of community and mental health services from its five 
legacy CCGs covering Enfield, Barnet, Haringey, Camden and Islington. 
This has led to a variation in access to services, the approach to delivering 
care and to patient outcomes. The purpose of the review is therefore to 
better understand this variation and then to develop a core service offer 
that will bring about greater consistency in access to community and 
mental health services for all NCL residents, driving out unwarranted 
variation whilst allowing local services to respond to variable patient need.  

 
1.3 The CCG has engaged Carnall Farrar as its partners to work alongside a 

CCG programme team. The two strategic service reviews are taking  
place between March and September 2021, when Carnall Farrar will 
present to the CCG core service offers, an impact assessment and a 
transition plan. The impact assessment will consider the financial and 
service implications of delivering the core service offers against the 
current levels of services. 

 
1.4 This paper provides information on the purpose of the review, its aims and 

objectives and governance. It will also update on progress, set out next 



steps and provide details on how users and residents are being engaged 
in both reviews.  

 
 
 

2. BACKGROUND TO THE REVIEW   
 

2.1  Information gathered as part of the Baseline Review shows there is 
variation in the clinical services staff provide, and therefore what services 
are available across NCL. For example with regards to housebound 
patients, although each Borough has access to a rapid response team 
they vary for example as to when referrals can be accepted. Some are 
24/7 but others only take referrals up to 8pm which limits the support 
available overnight to patients, acute trusts etc.  

 
2.2 The baseline reviews, which have been widely shared, sets out the case 

for change, provides further details on the differences in provision of 
services, differential funding, and workforce. The report also contains 
details of, for example, different waiting times as well as differences in 
patient outcomes. They will be available on the CCG’s website. An extract 
of both the community and mental health review is attached as an 
appendix for illustrative purposes 

 
3. AIMS AND OBJECTIVES OF THE REVIEWS  

 
3.1 The aim of the reviews is to ensure a consistent and equitable core 

service offer for the NCL population that is largely delivered at a 
neighbourhood/Primary Care Network level.  The core offer of equitable 
access to services will be based on identified local needs and fully 
integrated into the wider health and care system ensuring outcomes are 
optimised, as well as ensuring services are sustainable in line with the 
CCG’s financial strategy and workforce plans.  

 
3.2 Objectives of the review 
 

 The provision of a core and consistent service offer that is delivered 
locally based on identified needs and that works to reduce inequities of 
access and improves health outcomes. 

 The provision of community and mental health services that optimise 

the delivery of care across NHS Primary, Secondary, Tertiary services 

and the wider system with Local Authority and Voluntary & Charitable 

Sector (VCS) partners and services. 

 It will move the CCG closer to the national aspirations around the 

delivery of care as close to home as clinically appropriate and ensuring 

it is as accessible as possible. 

 It will provide a set of population health outcome measures that will 

help monitor progress supported by some key performance Indicators. 

 It will ensure that community and mental health services are financially 

sustainable systems both now and into the future based on the 

growing and changing needs of our population. 



 It will ensure the delivery of national planning guidance including the 

Long Term Plan and Mental Health Investment Standards. 

3.3 In addition, as part of the reviews, a set of design principles have been 
developed. These will be used as part of the impact assessment as a test 
against which the outputs of the review will be measured.  The design 
principles reflect an ambition for a forward looking review which puts 
service users and residents at the heart of the service delivery and which 
has a focus on prevention, early access and personalisation of care. 

 
4. SCOPE OF THE REVIEW  

 
4.1 The reviews include all CCG funded community and mental health 

services, both inpatient services and those provided in the community. It is 
an all age services review which includes both CAMHS and children and 
young peoples’ community services commissioned by the CCG.  It has a 
number of exclusions to try and manage the scope of the reviews e.g. 
primary care services, Continuing Health Care, acute services and 
learning disabilities etc. are excluded from the scope of these reviews. 

 
 

5. GOVERNANCE OF THE REVIEWS 
 
5.1 Both Service Reviews have established governance arrangements, 

underpinned by a Programme Board, which are both chaired by the 
CCG’s Accountable Officer. Each Programme Board comprises a 
Governing Body GP lead and a Governing Body Lay member lead as well 
as representatives from Provider Chief Executives, senior leadership from 
Local Authorities; Chief Executive leads, Directors of Adult and Children’s 
Services Leads and a Director of Public Health lead. Membership also 
includes the CCG Chief Finance Officer, ICS Lead Nurse and the 
Executive Director of Strategic Commissioning as the Senior Responsible 
Officer of the Service Reviews. Both Boards have service user and or 
voluntary sector membership.  

 
5.2 Each Programme Board meets monthly and is supported by an internal 

combined steering group which includes clinical lead GPs, representatives 
from the CCG's Quality, Communities, Communications and Engagement, 
Finance, Operations and Business Intelligence teams as well as 
Population Health input.   The steering group meets bi-weekly and it 
oversees the work with Carnall Farrar as well as reviewing and supporting 
the review and ensuring alignment to the wider work of the CCG. There 
are various sub groups which report into the steering group, including a 
finance and communications and engagement sub group. 

 
6. STRUCTURE OF THE REVIEWS   

     
6.1 Both the Community and mental health services reviews have followed a 

three phase approach. 
 
6.2 Phase One - Data Gathering to drive shared understanding of the 

problems 



 
This included data analysis to look at financial, contract and workforce 
data. Information was also collected on population needs both existing but 
given the impact of Covid particularly on mental health services, on future 
demand. Data gathering also included interviews with senior leaders from 
the CCG, Trusts and Local Authorities, group interviews with Local 
Authority colleagues and a survey which was sent out to a wide circulation 
list of GP, Trusts, Local Authority colleagues, CCG and voluntary 
sector/users etc. 

 
The initial phase of the Community Services Review was between March- 
April. As part of their work Carnall Farrar interviewed 56 senior leaders, 
and there were 228 survey forms returned. For the Mental Health services 
review 45 senior leaders were interviewed and 221 survey forms were 
returned. 

 
Information from phase one has been analysed and presented in the form 
of baseline reviews which summarises the data collected and sets out a 
case for change as to why the review is required. 

 
6.3 Phase Two - Design Workshops  
 

Phase two of the design process involved a series of online workshops 
and deep dives from June to mid-July. The initial introductory workshop 
involved over 100 people including colleagues from provider trusts, both 
clinical and operational, staff including GPs from the CCG, from Local 
Authorities, experts by experience and a small number of representatives 
from local voluntary organisations. Subsequent deep dives were 
specifically held for primary care so colleagues could consider service 
issues and contribute to the process although GP colleagues did also 
attend deep dives on community and mental health services.  

 
Overall there were three workshops held for both community and mental 
health services and each had over 60 attendees from the organisations 
and groups set out above. The process was iterative as each workshop 
considered the outputs from earlier discussions and added to the 
proposals. Pen pictures of fictional but ‘typical’ NCL residents were used 
to develop the core service offer and think about residents needs within 
their broader socio economic etc. context. As part of this process it was 
very clear that residents benefit the most from an integrated approach to 
service delivery, and from health staff working with Local Authority 
colleagues in social care, and education, housing, employment etc. as 
well. An integrated approach was seen as essential in supporting the best 
outcomes for patients.  

 
The development of the Integrated Care System (ICS) should provide the 
structure to further explore opportunities and build on the work and plans 
coming out of the CCG’s reviews of community and mental health 
services. 

 
6.4  Phase Three Refinement of core service offers and gap analysis 
 



At the end of phase two the CCG received two reports that contained the 
outputs of the development of the core service offer for community and 
mental health services. The reports contained  a description of each of the 
functions that should be available across NCL for different population 
segments, i.e. children and young people, young adults 18-25 (mental 
health only) working age and older people, and how the different functions 
integrate within the wider heath and care system.  

 
Specifically the core service offers were set out as a brief specifications for 
each function. The brief specification includes; what the function is e.g. 
community nursing and what it aims to deliver; it covers opening hours 
and out of hours provision, response times for initial contact and then 
responses times in line with national specifications etc. The specifications 
also cover who the service is for, how it might integrate or link with other 
services, where its delivered e.g. home based and the workforce 
capabilities needed to deliver the function e.g. that could be community 
nurses able to deliver intravenous antibiotic therapy. 
 
The core offers are now subject to a further detailed review and gap 
analysis to inform the next phase of work. Further details on this work are 
set out in section 9 of this paper. 

 
7. USER AND RESIDENT ENGAGEMENT WITH DESIGN PROCESS 

 
User/resident engagement has been a key part of the design process. 
Part of our engagement work has been achieved through attendance at 
meetings with statutory partners such as a number of Borough Health and 
Well Being Boards or NCL Health Over view Committees, and several 
NCL Health and Overview Committees 

 
However it also includes a number of presentations and discussions with 
community groups. For example in Enfield we have presented to the 
following meetings; Enfield Integrated Care Partnership; Enfield Voluntary 
and Community Sector Reference Group (VCSRG) Enfield PPG Network 
and Enfield Health and Wellbeing Board.   

 
Staff from the CCG including GPs have as also attended events organised 
to discuss the service reviews e.g. attendance at a Health watch Islington 
event and to an event organised by the Bridgwater Trust in Haringey. An 
engagement log has been set up and this is currently being reviewing to 
ensure that the CCG has been in contact and discussion with groups and 
organisations across all Boroughs, and with different population groups 
within and across boroughs. An update on this analysis will be presented 
to the Programme Boards for review and challenge. As the reviews 
progress we expect to re-attend a range of groups to provide the latest 
update and next steps. 

 
We have also involved users especially our experts by experience group 
at our core service offer design meetings and they have had the 
opportunity to contribute to the review of proposals and help shape their 
current form. As we move to agreeing the final core service offers we need 



to agree how best to involve these colleagues in our transition planning 
work. 

 
The CCG also set up a patient survey which was open for three months 
and generated approx. 112 responses including 32 from Enfield residents. 
These have been reviewed and triangulated with other feedback received 
and with an earlier review of existing feedback reports. We have also been 
updating our Residents Reference Group on the comments we have 
received. The Residents Reference Group has also been asked to review 
and comment on the core service offer proposals and particularly consider 
these from a user/resident perspective. 
 
 
7.1 Feedback From User/Resident Engagement .  
 
As part of the design process for the core service offers we have been 
keen to correlate the comments and views of users/residents and ensure 
these are incorporated into our core service descriptions where 
appropriate. Comments have been broadly summarised below in terms of 
the need for improvement and or action;  

 Model of mental health care; more community based, proactive and 

focused on earliest possible intervention 

 Both Community and Mental health services need to improve 

access (this includes waiting times, time for first contact, ability to 

communicate especially the availability of interpreting services 

including British Sign Language 

 Both community and mental health services need to be more 

dementia friendly and think more about those with other needs 

especially sensory problems 

 Both Community and Mental health services need to reduce the 

number of hand offs and make better use of technology to avoid 

people having to frequently  repeat their details/stories  

 Both Community and Mental Health services need to improve 

communications with patients especially when appointments are 

changed, cancelled etc. and have a better processes for 

responding to patient enquires etc. 

 A move to digital was welcomed by some but there was strong 

counter view that the digital divide was widening and that health 

services must offer a mix of delivery mechanisms not just rely on a 

digital approach 

 All patients wanted services to be personalised and for their care to 

be considered in the context of their lives and circumstances as 

well as wanting to be involved in any decisions on their care 

 Transition planning especially from children to adult services was 

highlighted as problematic and requiring an earlier start than is 

currently happening 



 Services must be culturally competent and Providers need to work 

with their communities to recruit more local people and use their 

experience and knowledge  to work more effectively with diverse 

local populations 

The themes coming from our review of earlier work on engagement, our 
residents’ survey and feedback from our Residents Reference Group have 
been very consistent in terms of overall comments and identification of 
areas for improvement. Where appropriate some of these themes have 
been captured within our core service design e.g. our work on mental 
health is designed to be more proactive and focused on early intervention 
so we can move away, over time from an over reliance on inpatient care. 
Our core service offers have set out the improved response and waiting 
times we will move to commission; we have included a service description 
for transition and have, in line with national best practice, described an 18-
25 year old service for mental health recognising the challenge for some 
young people of moving directly into the working age services. As part of 
the core service offer we have described our ambition to set up single 
points of access, and the wider and more consistent introduction of a 
trusted assessor role, along with case management and case coordination 
for those with complex needs. When fully implemented this should 
address a number of comments on hand offs, repetition of histories as well 
as providing a better response to patient enquires etc. 

 
However a number of the comments will be better addressed by provider 
colleagues as they relate directly to how services are delivered.  Further 
thought and discussion with the residents reference group  will take place 
on how best the comments and feedback from engagement events, 
residents’ survey etc. can be shared and how the health system in NCL 
can demonstrate it has listened and taken action on the feedback it has 
received.   

  
8. SUPPORTING DELIVERY OF THE CORE SERVICES OFFER: 

DEVELOPMENT OF OUTCOMES FRAMEWORK 
 

Given the ambitions set out in the design principles and the aims and 
objectives for the reviews in terms of creating a sustainable and affordable 
service model across NCL that addresses inequalities, spreads good 
practice and improves outcomes for residents, in conjunction with Carnall 
Farrar, we have developed a set of outcome measures to underpin the 
delivery of the core service offer. There are already a large number of 
service indicators and performance measures required nationally and as 
part of our service contracts, so the outcome framework designed to be 
part of the delivery of the core service offers has focused on a small 
number of high level indicators. These are intended to track how the CCG 
and then the ICS is delivering against its broad objective of improving 
equity of access to community and mental health services. Indicators 
include measurement of population well-being and independence, moving 
from reactive and crisis care to proactive planned care, and for the 
workforce, a measure on cultural competency to recognise comments 
made during our user and resident engagement. These will be presented 
to Programme Boards for review and signoff in September. 



 
9. IMPACT ASSESMENT INCLUDING FINANCIAL ANALYSIS AND NEXT 

STEPS 
 
Following discussion with finance colleagues from the CCG and Provider 
Trusts it has been agreed with Carnall Farrar that, rather than use 
incomplete costing information from trusts, a population based approach 
to costing would be used.  
 
The financial sub group set up to oversee the financial impact assessment 
has received and agreed details of the methodologies used to calculate 
relative levels of need. This agreed methodology allows a comparison to 
be made with the funding the CCG receives annually based on the 
national allocation formula index against current spend. Once this work is 
completed it should allow the CCG, and partners to understand the 
financial implications of the core service offer. 
 

10. REVIEW OF CORE SERVICE OFFERS AND GAP ANALYSIS 
 
Before the financial impact assessment can be completed, there are two 
outstanding pieces of work that will need to be completed.  During August 
and into September the CCG in conjunction with provider trust colleagues 
has been reviewing the core service offers.  This work is being completed 
for both community and mental health services. What the current 
discussions are not designed to do is to describe how the core service 
offers will then be delivered. This will be the subject of more detailed 
discussions with providers and other partners including for instance 
Primary Care Networks etc. once the respective Community and Mental 
Health Service Review Programme Boards have signed off the core 
service offers and agreed the system’ s readiness to start to undertake 
more detailed transition planning. 
 
In addition to the detailed discussion and review on core service offers, 
Community and Mental Health Trust and Borough leads and CCG 
colleagues, including clinical leads have been asked to review a gap 
analysis which has been produced and which, once validated will be used 
as part of the financial analysis to understand the additional costs that will 
be required to fund the core service offers.  The gap analysis describes 
the services as they are currently provided, compared with what is 
proposed in the new the core service offers. Given the approach to costing 
described above its essential the gap analysis is accurate, owned and 
agreed by Provider Trust colleagues. 
 
Both the detailed review of the core service offers and the review of the 
gap analysis will be completed in early September and will be passed over 
to Carnall Farrar to firstly update the core service offers, and thereby the 
gap analysis. When this is agreed, work can then be completed on the 
financial analysis in preparation for a discussion with the Community 
Service Review Programme Board on 24th September and the Mental 
Health Services Review Programme Board on 30th September. 

 
11. COMMISSIONING OF A CONSISTENT CORE SERVICE OFFER 



 
In commissioning the two service reviews and by deliberately setting out 
its aims and objectives designed to achieve consistency and reduce 
inequalities of access to services, NCL CCG has accepted that it will need 
to make some difficult decisions to be able to fund a consistent core 
service offer. 
 
The current gaps, based on historic patterns of spend will require the 
development of a detailed transition plan which will include funding, and 
timescales to delivery given current workforce constraints. The CCG 
working within the emerging ICS will need to make some challenging 
decisions on how it will potentially reallocate existing spending, look at 
opportunities to move funding from the acute sector into out of hospital 
care, use new growth funding and look for greater efficiencies in service 
delivery. It will also need to look at opportunities for different 
commissioning models for example use of capitated budgets or provider 
collaboratives. 
 
These more detailed discussions on transition options for both providers 
and commissioners will take place from mid-September once the detailed 
work to refine the core service offer and a revised gap analysis is 
completed and signed off by both providers and the CCG. The core 
service offers are due to be reviewed at the Community Services 
Programme Board on 24th September and the Mental Health Programme 
Board on 30th September. 

 
12. NEXT STEPS 
 

During September and into October the CCG will be working closely with 
provider colleagues to start to shape a transition plan which will start to set 
out different options for delivery, including high level funding options. Once 
there is a draft  high level transition plan, further engagement and 
discussion will need to take place with partners, including Local Authority, 
users and residents etc. on implications, timescales etc. 
 
It is expected these initial discussions will need to be completed by late 
November so the CCG Governing Body at its December meeting could be 
in a position to make a decision on how the core service offer could be 
implemented and then overseen by the CCG/ ICS as part of its 
governance and oversight role. An updated communications and 
engagement strategy will be developed and will run in parallel with this 
work during September- December with the intension of ensuring partners 
especially local residents are kept up to date on proposals.    

 
13. CONCLUSION 

 
Considerable progress has been made to develop a core service offer 
which meets the CCG’s ambition to achieve a consistent service offer to 
all NCL residents. During the summer the draft core service offers have 
been subject to a detailed joint review between the CCG and Provider 
Trust colleagues as has a review of a gap analysis.    
 



Although a detailed costing of the core service offer is also being 
completed during September it is clear that the current level of resources 
will be insufficient to meet the additional funding required. The CCG will 
need to decide how it is prepared to fund the gap and the options 
available to ensure a core service offer is delivered across NCL. A more 
detailed update to Local Authorities will be provided as work progresses 
but given the complexity of this work further time may be needed to fully 
understand the implications, costs and pace of change arising from these 
reviews. 

 
14. RECOMMENDATION 

 

 
The Enfield Health and Adult Social Care Scrutiny Panel is asked to note the 
progress of the community and mental health service reviews and the next 
steps set out in this paper. 

 


